
To: Bella Klei 
From: 
Sent: on 018 3:51:35 PM 
Subject: Re: My reimubursemnets! $795.32 

got it! working on excel now! 

> On Nov 12, 2018, at 10:49 AM, Bella Klein wrote: 

> i will give rich $800, please send change back:)) 
> Thank you, 
> Bella 

>> On Nov 12, 2018, at 10:44 AM, wrote: 

>> Bella. I am hurredly getting my reimbursements put together so Rich can bring 
me cash when he comes today at 11:30am.1 need to get on the excel spread 
sheet-but wanted you to know the total is: $795.32 
> <Scan 468.pdf><Scan 467.pdf><Scan 465.pdf><Scan 466.pdf><Scan 464.pdf><Scan 
463.pdf> 
>> 

» if i can't get to you in time, you can always send a check 
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