
To: 
From: 
Sent: Tue 11/6/2018 3:34:29 PM 
Subject: Re: We have a ticket for Natalya Litvinova 

Jan 

On Tue, Nov 6, 2018 at 4:10 PM wrote: 

We have a ticket for Natalya Litvinova worth $591.30 that we exchanged back on Sept. 6 for 
Nov. 12th...if you think she will come visit you at some point, do you want to exchange the 
ticket again for some time in January? We will have to pay any difference in fare and an 
exchange fee to do so. (from what I recall Natalya never was able to get her visa) 
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