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Thank you so much Lesley!!! 
I'm looking forward to 

On Dec 1, 2018, at 7:38 PM, Lesley Groff c:: > wrote: 

Ok super. Thanks M. I will find out what address Jojo needs delivery to. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 1, 2018, at 1:35 PM, anima Apcomesa < > wrote: 

From the movers/ moving company... 
So, I'am thinking maybe better just hire the moving company, who 
can provide the insurance paper and will be able to disassemble the 
bed and deliver it to the addrese where Jojo would like? 
I also have a table and two chairs, can Jojo be interested in it as well? 
( Photo attached) <IMG_7589.jpeg> 

Ill connect with the moving company right now and check the price for moving out 
process. 

Will be right back to you 

On Dec 1 2018 at 7:02 PM, Lesley Groff 
wrote: 

Thank you for the information. Question though, the building needs insurance 
from who? Jojo and Merwin were just going to rent a 
Ubaul truck and move the bed themselves. Is that OK? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 1, 2018, at 12:41 PM, 
wrote: 

The bed is still in my apt 
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The only problem is that the building is 
re uired insurance paper it has to be sent 

by Fax to the resident manager, 
Geovanni Bernardino 

for moving out. 
I booked the elevator for the Monday 
morning from 8 am till 11 am. 

On Sat, Dec 1, 2018 at 3:07 PM Lesley Groff 
wrote: 

Hi ! Jojo would love it. Where is the 
bed? 

Sent from my iPhone 

> On Dcc 1, 2018, at 7:09 AM 3mila A cexbeaa 
wrote: 

> Dear Lesley, 

> Jeffrey told me to send you photos of the bed, which I had in my apt 
in New York in case if Jojo wants it... 

> Please, see the files attached. 

> Thank you! 
> Best Regards, 
> M> <Screen Shot 2018-11-27 at 9.03.49 

PM.png><IMG2588.jpeg> 

Best Re ai stl 
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