
To: 
From: Bella Klein 
Sent: Mon 12/24/2018 2:21:30 PM 
Subject: Re: Payment Required - Payment For 1 Room 

Arc you waiting for JE approval and will you prepay or I should, please advise 

Thank you, 
Bella 

On Dcc 24, 2018, at 9:18 AM, > wrote: 

FYI-I must prc pay for the room at the Atlantis via the link below... 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Atlantis The Palm IMIIIIME> 
Subject: Payment Require - ayment or oom 
Date: December 24, 2018 at 9:17:08 AM EST 

To: 
Reply-To: Kristian Co ‹ > 

Dea:
Greetings from Atlantis The Palm! 
We would like to inform you that payment is now required for your Payment for 1 Room with 
reference: 
The deadline for payment is 11:00 PM on 24 December, 2018. 
Please check the details below then click the link to proceed with payment using our secure transaction 
platform. 

Description: 

payment for 1 room inclusive of Bronze Gala dinner package. 

Booking will be released if payment is not received after the payment deadline. 

Pa AED 31,748.6 

For any enquiries, or if you have any concerns about the authenticity of this email, please contact the 
Reservations at or by telephone on or see answers 
to Frequently Asked Questions 
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Kind Regards, 
Atlantis The Palm 
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