
To: 
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Mon 12/10/2018 8:03:06 PM 
Subject: Re: Check to southern Trust from me for loan 

yes you are correct an interest payment is due Dec 19th 
i am still trying to connect with jee for your next loan..and bonus.. 

not sure if you are aware but trip to LSJ for darren and myself was canceled as 
the entire STC office is sick.. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

> on Dec 10, 2018, at 9:15 AM, wrote: 

> Hi Rich. I show I Need to write a check to Southern Trust for $2110 due By 
December 19. This is for interest on $100,000 at 2.11%. Can you confirm i have 
this all correct and i will send check this week. 

> Sent from my iPhone 
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