
To: 
Fran: 
Sent 
Subject 

I 
Lesley Groff 
Sun 12/9/2018 8:24:00 PM 
Re: passport details 

Not to worry. Bella can wire her the money. You gave us her details before I believe. 
See you soon in NY! 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 9, 2018, at 2:32 PM, 

Sony 

't > wrote: 

Lesley, 
Jeffrey wants to book it by herself already. So I will tell her. I think she 
will needs just to cover all expenses 

ec, 9 Am 2018 r. B 12:14, Lesley Groff dc >: 

Hi ..thank you for details, but please advise ...she needs airline 
tickets? from where to where? What are the days of travel? or does she need a 
hotel? I need some more information before I can start...! thanks, Lesley 

> On Dec 9, 2018, at 11:15 AM, wrote: 

> Hi Lesley! Hosou? 
> I'm sending details as she needs booking confirmation and tickets by an 

appointment at the embassy 
> It will be in January 2nd 

> Sheleg 

> Number: 

> Date of birth: 

> Date of issue: 

> End date: 

> --
> Best rc ards 

EFTA_R1_01070818 
EFTA02266740



Best re ards 
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