
To: Natalia Molotkova 
From: 
Sent: Wed 12/12/2018 7:30:44 PM 
Subject: Re: Change ticket back to Paris (Rec. Loc#GGS ELZ) 

This was already changed. I changed it last night. At least it should have been. Please check. I 
received a confirm last night for return on 18th 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 12, 2018, at 2:14 PM, Natalia Molotkova wrote: 

What about this one? 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

(877) 877-0987 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Your response is required to complete this reservation. Prices and availability are subject to 
change. 

• Total air reservation, including taxes and fees: $171.00 (add collect, exchange). 

• Ticket is non-refundable, $171.00 change applies plus difference in fare 

• Mon 17 Dec - Air France 7 - Economy - 7h 20m 
Departing: New York John F Kennedy Airport, (JFK) at 18:40 
Arriving: Paris Charles de Gaulle Airport, (CDG) at 08:00 (on the 18 Dec) 

Please reply to this email and provide your authorization to proceed. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

(877) 877-0987 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 
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On it. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

(877) 877-0987 

Flours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Thank you for your email. I am currently out of the office. 

We need to change Ms ticket back to Paris to depart on Dec. 17th please (Rec. 
Loc#GGSELZ) 
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