
To: ova 
From: 
Sent: Mon 12/17/2018 2:43:14 PM 
Subject: Re: Credit at a hotel in Marrakech 

Jeffrey wants to get the 3 ladies (Karyna, rooms at the Mandarin. He says not 
to worry about the credit. Let me know coat and let's reserve the 3 rooms or maybe a suite with 
2 bedrooms? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 17, 2018, at 9:40 AM, Natalia Molotkova wrote: 

OK, you sent me reservation, it was 2016, usually credits are no longer than 1 year, I will 
call them, ask. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

(877) 877-0987 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Never mind. Jeffrey said to not worry about the credit. It is 2 years old. 

Sent from my iPhone 

Under Jeffrey Epstein's name for credit 

Sent from my iPhone 

We think we might have a credit with the Mandarin in Marrakech. Is it possible for you to 
call the hotel and ask? 

Sent from my iPhone 

I am really sorry, I don't remember anything about any credit. When was the 
booking, who was guest, when was cancellation? Why credit? 
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Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

(877) 877-0987 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Mandarin in Marrakech? 

Sent from my iPhone 

I don't remember anything about credit. When was it? 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

(877) 877-0987 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

La Mamounia? 

Sent from my iPhone 

I don't remember, sorry. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

(877) 877-0987 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 
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It was a very fancy hotel in Marrakech. Ok. Maybe it was not through you? 

Sent from my iPhone 

Morning, no, I do not re-call that. I am sorry. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

(877) 877-0987 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Good morning Natasha. Do you recall us having a credit at some hotel in Marrakesh? What 
hotel was that and do we still have a credit? 

Sent from my iPhone 
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