
To: Natalia Molotkova 
From: 
Sent: Tue 12/18/2018 3:06:35 PM 
Subject: Re: VOID 's ticket MMTLOQ and Re BOOK the direct flight Sat. Dec. 22 

Please issue ticket as shown below for Thanks. 

Sent from my iPhonc 

On Dec 18, 2018, at 9:52 AM, Natalia Molotkova wrote:

Your response is required to complete this reservation. Prices and availability are subject to 
change. 

• Total air reservation, including taxes and fees: $195.50. 

• Ticket is refundable, changes are subject to difference in fare. 

• Sat 22 Dec - Air France 1077 - Economy - 3h 30m 
Departing: Menara Airport, Marrakech (RAK) at 13:35 

Please reply to this email and provide your authorization to proceed. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

(877) 877-0987 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

OK, on it. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

(877) 877-0987 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 
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Morning! Can you please void the ticket we purchased for =last night (MMTLOQ) and 
book her on the direct flight from Marrakech to Paris at 1:35pm arriving 5:50pm Sat. Dec. 
22 

thanks. 
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