
To: Natalia Molotkova 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent: Tue 12/4/2018 8:31:27 PM 
Subject: Re: Void and rebook ticket for 

Please issue ticket below as stated 

Sent from my iPhonc 

On Dec 4, 2018, at 3:19 PM, Natalia Molotkova < EM> wrote: 

Your response is required to complete this reservation. Prices and availability are subject to 
change. 

• Total air reservation, including taxes and fees: $2436.23. 

• Ticket is non-refundable, EUR35.00 change penalty applies plus difference in fare 

• Thu 06 Dec - Aeroflot 100 - Economy - 10h 15m 
Departing: Moscow Sheremetyevo Airport, (SVO) at 10.10am 
Arriving: New York John F Kennedy Airport, (JFK) at 12.25pm 

• Sat 15 Dec - Aeroflot 103 - Economy - 9h 15m 
Departing: New York John F Kennedy Airport, (JFK) at 7.10pm 
Arriving: Moscow Sheremetyevo Airport, (SVO) at 12.25pm 

Please reply to this email and provide your authorization to proceed. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

OK 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 
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Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

We need to void the ticket we purchased yesterday for and rebook same 
ticket but to arrive on Thursday Dec 6. Ok? 

Sent from my Phone 
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