To:  Centurion Suppor

From: Lesley Groff
Sent: Fri 1/4/2018 12:23:16 PM
Subject: Re: - Ms e

Good morning ves we need to cover incidentals as well can you please update the form? Thank
you so very much!

Sent from my 1Phone

On Jan 4, 2019, at 4:05 AM, Centurion Support _} wrote:

Good morning,
Below is the link for the prepayment of the hotel for tomorrow.

The link covers the hotel and taxes, if you would like it to cover any incidentals, please let us
know and we can get it updated.

Thank you,
Vanessa

From Centurion Support on behalf of Nataliyour Relationship Manager

This is a secure payment link for room and tax only.

Kind regards,
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i Daria Petrova I
Reservations Associate

In using the "Pay Now" link added above, you expressly confirm that yeu have ordered products or services from "Intereontinental
London Park Lane®. In using this link you confirm that you have received, read, understood and accapted the offer and the Terms
and Conditions of Business of the vendor enclosed with this email.

Saferpay - powered by

The cantent of this e-mail is intended only for the confidential use of the person addressed.
if you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender and delete this e-mail immediately.
Thank you.

American Express made the following annotations

"This message and any attachments are solely for the intended recipient and may contain
confidential or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure,
copying, use, or distribution of the information

included in this message and any attachments is prohibited. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us by reply e-mail and immediately and permanently
delete this message and any attachments. Thank you."

American Express a ajoute le commentaire suivant le

Ce courrier et toute piéce jointe qu'il contient sont réservés au seul destinataire indigqué et
peuvent renfermer des renseignements confidentiels et privilégiés. Si vous n'étes pas le
destinataire prévu, toute divulgation, duplication, utilisation ou distribution du courrier ou de
toute piéce jointe est interdite. Si vous avez regu cette communication par erreur, veuillez
nous en aviser par courrier et détruire immeédiatement le courrier et les piéces jointes.
Merci.
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