To: Jeffrey Epstein[ieevacation@gmail.com)
From: Lesley Groff

Sent: Sun 12/23/2018 9:52:03 PM

subject: Re: [l trip

The flights [l chose are $3014.50 each Non Refundable on Emirates. Economy sold out on
the return. Biz only. (Refundable is $4299.50 each) 1 found Air France round trip flights with
less desirable timing at $1055.10 Non Refundable.

Do I purchase the Flights she wants on Emirates or the AF flights.._.don’t want to spend your
money without asking!  Also, The Atlantis least expensive room is approx. S1000 per a
night...at 10 nights the total would be $12,750 included taxes and fees...we are within
cancelation policy so once booked we cannot cancel. Do we look at a different hotel?

I am holding the Emirates flights. ..

Please advise what we should book for them...

On Dec 23, 2018, at 1:36 PM, J <jeevacation{@gmail.com=> wrote:

she needs to give you details  you are not a travel agent, you can pay.

On Sun, Dec 23, 2018 at 1:35 PM Lesley Groff ||| G- v ot

OK to book below trip for [ her sister?

Begin forwarded message:

From: [ I - -
Subject: Christmas
Date: December 23, 2018 at 1:33:49 PM EST

To: I

Hey LeSley , how are you 7 Can you please organise for me and my sister a trip to
Dubai . Departure tomorrow and back the 3rd of january . Staying at
the Atlantis Hotel

Envoyé de mon iPhone

please note
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