
To: 
From: 
Sent 
Subject: Re: Loan Payment 

Richard Kahn 

Tue 12/18/2018 3:27:30 PM 

No worries. He got frustrated with me last night. So if you wait a few days maybe it's better! 
Ha. (So many demands at all hours and any days/weekend /holiday ... which I'm happy to do. 
But sometime I have things happening in my life also with people depending on me blah blah 

blab. I do my best to balance. That is between you and me. !!! ) 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 18, 2018, at 8:56 AM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

thank you 
still trying to pin down jee for bonuses / loan etc.. 
hopefully today.. 
will circle back in next day or two.. 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

On Dec 17, 2018, at 8:59 PM, 
wrote: 

HI Rich...I have my next reminder for loan... I will send a check soon to Southern 
Trust.Thanks, Lesley 

Pay Southern Trust 1.97% of $100,000 ($1970.00) by Jan. 3 Until Jan. 
2, 2026 (Maturity Date) 

EFTA_R1_01073273 
EFTA02268383


