To: Bella Klein{{ NG

From: Lesley Groff
Sent: Thur 12/6/2018 3:11:44 PM

Subject: Re: Pay for your hotel stay with your Amex

Sent from my 1Fhone

> On Dec &, 2018, at 10:03 AM, Bella Klein -:_w::te:

> Les,

> He knows or authorized?
hi=z notifications.

> Thank you,
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available on your card. Ok!? Lesley
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»>»>> Sent from my iPhone
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Please let him know charges as he w

> On Dec 6, 2018, at 9:54 AM, Bella Klein _ wrote:

>>> Hopefully we have JE permission for - family hotel

use ")-'-S.': Al
be easier as the
from

just

Thi=z will
form

to have the money

see 1t 1n

>>>> on Dec 6, 2018, at 9:41 aM, Lesley croff || NG :ot-:
»>>>» Hi - Bella has confirmed it is OK

for your and your families reocoms while in Minsk.
hotel likes to see the credit card when you
ta £ill out a third-party credit card authori
possibly get denied at the last minute. Bella will make sure

Lo pay
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