
To: 
Cc: Bella Klein 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent: Mon 12/24/2018 2:10:40 PM 
Subject: Re: Can you use your CC for the Atlantis/Bella wire you funds? 

ok will work on this 

> on Dec 24, 2018, at 9:05 AM, < > wrote:

> No , i can't exceed a certain amount with my cb 

> Envoye de mon iPhone 

>> Le 24 dec. 2018 A 14:59, > a ecrit : 

» • HI .can you use your own CC for the Atlantis and Bella can wire you the 
funds.11illi
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