
To: Kevin Ouvri fr] 
Fran: Lesley Groff 
Sent Thur 12/13/201811:01:18 PM 
Subject Re: INVOICE 

HI Kevin...ok thank you! 

On Dec 13, 2018, at 5:50 PM, Kevin Ouvre ‹ > wrote: 

Good Evening Lesley, 

Please find attached my invoice for landscape studies started. 

Best regards, 

Kévin. 
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SAS KO CONCEPT 
Kevin Ouvré 

Architecte paysagiste 
Anse des Cayes. 
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