To  Lesiey cror R

From: Richard Kahn
Sent: Wed 12/18/2018 7:26:20 PM
Subject: Re: wire

great
my pleasure

Richard Kahn
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funds arrived First Republic.thank you so much for your help Rich.
appreciate it.!
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>> thank you
»» wire of 110,000 will be in your account by lpm

= [J'E"rl.’ii" confirm receipt

»>» Richard Kahn
=>» HBREK Associates Inc.
>> 272 Lexington Avenue 4th Floc
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=>> On Dec 19, 2018, at 11:15 AM, Lesley Groff wrote:
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=>»> NY, NY
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»»>> On Dec 15, 2018, at 10:42 AM, Richard Kahn _ Wwrote:

»> please advise which account to send to today..
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thanks

»»>>» Richard Kahn

»»>>» HBRE Associates Inc.

273 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
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