
To: Lesley Grofq 
Fran: Bella Klein 
Sent Thu 18 4:32:02 PM 
Subject Re: amily's pricing (just FYI) 

should i add 2k to her card? 
Thank you, 
Bella 

On Dec 6, 2018, at 11:10 AM, Lesley Groff •: =• wrote: 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: J <.eevacation mail.com> 
Subject: Re: Family's pricing Oust FYI) 
Date: December 6, 2018 at 11:09.05 AM EST 
To: Lesley Groff < 

yes , of course 

On Thu, Dec 6, 2018 at 11:07 AM Lesley Groff wrote: 

Below are costs for_family to travel to Minsk Dec. 14-16! 
:) :) 

Total Air: $1248.00 
Aprrox. room charge: $989.00 (3 rooms) 
Approx. suite charge: $1072.00 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
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communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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