To: Rich Kahn

Cc: Bella Klein

From: Lesley Gro

Sent: Thur 12/6/2018 4.:40:39 PM

Subject: Re: HBRK ASSOCIATES INC & Apple Business : Europe

-Below from the Paris Apple Rep-they will not accept checks.

the means of payment in AppleStore are the credit card and cash (1000 € max) only . The check
are not accepted.
A manual invoicing can be created in Store with the company address.

-Below is from James and the reason we are questioning whether to buy in US or Paris.

Again, the consequence of people getting US watches outside of the US is that they will not be
able to activate the cellular connectivity. It will work as expected as long as their paired 1Phone 15
within range.

-1 think we send .-0 the Apple Store with her credit card and reimburse her. Seems the best
solution and casiest. Bella can wire her the money. This being said, -wili not be back n
Paris until Dec. 14th or so. She is quite capable of purchasing 5 watches and shipping them to the
end recipient.

-Sorry to keep going back and forth on this. | am ready to be done with it. | already told the
recipients it could take up to 5 weeks to receive their watch,

On Dec 6, 2018, at 11:19 AM, Richard Kahn _-} Wrote:

i am ok however i would like to purchase asap
Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor

72

On Dec 6, 2018, at 10:03 AM, Lesley ul-oﬁ_
Wrote:

I believe the best solution. Thx
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Sent from my iPhone

On Dec 6, 2018, at 9:57 AM, Bella chin-',?? wrote:

So let - buy it and we will reimburse..
Thank you,
Bella

On Dec 6, 2018, at 9:43 AM, Lesley Groff

It is for two Paris Watches -md Waldson). 2London watches and
one Russian watch.

Sent from my iPhone

On Dec 6, 2018, at 9:35 AM, Bella Klcin <G

wWrote:

[s 1t for Paris?
Thank you,
Bella

Begin forwarded
messa gL‘:

From: "Martin
O'Brien, Apple
Business UES"
<uppereastsideb
usiness{@apple.c
om=>

Subject: Re:
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HBRK
ASSOCIATES
INC & Apple
Business :
Europe

Date: December
6, 2018 at
9:27:06 AM EST

To:

F, Rich
ahn

$1

Lesley Groff
I

Hi Marché Samnt-Germain Team -

Hope you're all doing well!

We've been reaching out to the Opéra Business Team with
no responsc and
our client, HBRE.,
has been patiently
awaiting assistance
to place an order.

Are you able to assist with getting this order pulled
together based on
Quote
#2205191882
( Attached)?

Please reply all to this email and Lesley or Bella will
provide you with
any information you
need to get this
order placed.

Your urgent assistance is greatly appreciated.

Best Wishes,
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Martin O'Brien
Business Expert
Apple Upper East Side

<Quote | for
HBREK 112118 550 CC Euro
pe + 2205191882 pdf=>

On
Dec 6,
2018,
at 8:13
AM,
Lesley

Wrote:

Hello Opera Business Team-Can anyone assist with
our
Apple
Watch
Order?
We
still
await a
reply.

Thank vou,

Lesley

On Dec 4, 2018, at 10:26 AM, Martin
O'Brien, Apple Business UES

Hi Opéra Business Team -

I'm reaching out to see if one of your team
members can please followup with Lesley and
the team at HBRK to help them place the
order noted below,
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Best Wishes,

Martin O'Brien
Business Expert
Apple Upper East Side

On Deg 3 2 ' Lesley
Groft M — wrote:

Thank you very much for the
introduction Martin.

-I confirm the watch orders are correct.
-1 confirm all addresses for recipients
arc correct.

Please let us know what else we can
provide to place this order.

Thank you,
Lesley

On MNov 30, 2018, at 5:53 PM,
Martm O'Brien, Apple Business
UES

m=> wWrote;
Hi Opéra Business team -

I'm writing to connect you to the
team at HBRK Associates: one of
our most valued clients!

Lesley, Rich and Bella are
working on placing a large order
for Apple Watches in the US and
would like some support in
purchasing a few watches in
Europe.
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Can you please create a quote
based on the attached

Quote 2205191882 and
corresponding spreadsheet for
shipment addresses.

Please connect with Bella Klein
(cc’d) and advise her on any
information she may need to
provide in order to get this
completed.

Your support 1s appreciated.
Thanks!

Any questions, please let me
know!

Best Wishes,

Martin O'Brien
Business Expert

<uote | for

HBRK 112118 S50 CC Europ
¢+ 2205191882 + Europe
Updated 11.30.18 pdf>

<HBRK Europe.numbers>

EFTA_R1_01079140
EFTA02270863



