
To: JUeevacationepgmail.comi 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent Mon 12/17/2018 2:39:35 PM 
Subject: Re: Four seasons Marrakech? We need hotel 

Ok. I sent an email follow up to Mark Lloyd about hotel accommodations for the girls. Waiting to 
hear back. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 17, 2018, at 9:37 AM, J leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

its ok dorm worry about credit 

On Mon, Dec 17, 2018 at 9:32 AM Lesley Groff > wrote: 

Or mandarin in Marrakech? Amex says we do not have a credit. I will continue 
to investigate 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 17, 2018, at 7:58 AM, J leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

what htel did we have the credit with . 

On Mon, Dec 17, 2018 at 7:33 AM Lesley Groff > wrote: 

Do we book four seasons for and =for 
Marrakech? 
We are within cancel policy. 
Sony, here is Four Seasons: 

PREMIER GARDEN VIEW TERRACE ROOM 
KING BED - 420.00EUR per night plus tax per 
room. 

Your response is required to complete this 
reservation. Prices and availability are subject to 
change. 

• Estimated total for hotel reservation: 
EUR2550.00. Daily resort and additional fees may 
apply. 

Cancellation is 7 days. 
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Sent from my iPhonc 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to Leevacationqt umai Learn, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jecvacation@gmail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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