
< => 

To: 
From: 
Sent: 
Subject: 

Lesley Groff 
Thur 1/31/2019 7:03:54 PM 
Re: Italy 

, In order to pay for your hotel room I have to prepay ...means no 
cancellations or changes—or I can reserve you the hotel room but you have to pay 
at the hotel. If I reserve and you pay at hotel you can cancel up to 24 hours 
before arrival. Are you sure you will go? If so, I will book your room and 
prepay. If not, is it possible for you to pay and be reimbursed? Let me know 
what is best. 

> On Jan 31, 2019, at 12:33 PM, < > wrote:

> Sure we can do this one . Is it possible to book the ticket with the luggage 
please ? 

> Envoye de mon iPhone 

>> Le 31 janv. 2019 a 16:19, Lesley Groff <II > a ecrit : 
>> 

we can do AF depart 12:20pm from CDG arrive Linate 1:50pm— return 
8:30pm back to CDG at 10:05pm..ok? that is closest flight to 5pm back to CDG from 
Linate 

>> On Jan 31, 2019, at 8:26 AM, < > wrote: 
>» 
>» Would be great if I leave Paris around 12 pm and leave Milan the 6th around 
5pm 
>» 

>>> Envoye de mon iPhone 
>» 
>>» Le 31 janv. 2019 a 14:22, Lesley Groff < a ecrit : 
>>» 
>>>> Ok. Does timing matter? You car depart anytime and return any time? 
>>» 
>>>> Sent from my iPhone 
>>» 
>»» On Jan 31, 2019, at 8:00 AM, < > wrote:
>>>>> 
>>>» Also , can you please organize me the hotel and if you can pay it with OE 
card because I had some issues with CB . I would like to stay at Me Il Duca . For 
the flight Air France or Alitalia land in Milan linate . 
>>>» 
>»» Envoi/6 de mon iPhone 
>>>>> 
>>»» Le 31 janv. 2019 a 13:14, Lesley Groff < 
>>>>>> 
>>>>>> Morning! Can you give me the exact flight details you would like 
(airline, flight t and timing... or if it doesn't matter I'll choose). Just let 
me know. Thanks. Lesley 
>>>>>> 
>>»» Sent from my iPhone 
>>>>» 
>>>>>>> On Jan 30, 2019, at 7:23 PM, 
>>>>>» 
>>>>>» Hey Lesley , can you please organise a ticket for me to go to Milan on 
Saturday (linate airport) and back on the 06th of February please ? 
>>>>>» 

> a ecrit : 

wrote: 
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>>>»» Envoye de mon iPhone 
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