To:

From: Bella Klein

Sent: Wed 1/16/2019 11:14:31 PM
Subject: Re: Blue Amex

Correct, nothing I can do..

Thank you,
Bella

On Jan 16, 2019, at 5:23 PM‘_ wrote:

she is on JE’s plane now. . they just landed .. but she is then boarding a
commercial flight back to NY tonight! she will be in NY for tomorrow then she
flies back to PB on Friday...she may not answer you right away ;) Then YOU go
away on holiday ...project for when you return perhaps.

On Jan 16, 2019, at 4:52 PM. Bella Klein _

Wrote:

Hope that Karyna will respond to my email than 1 can approach her for the phone
number or address for the pharmacy, maybe we can get a refund..

Thank you,
Bella

On Jan 162019 at 4-46 PM. ||| | |Gz

I'm sure not. The only pharmacy I have used for JE 1s Zitomer's and 1t has
been awhile for that one. Jeffrey has asked me to use
Vitahealth for his prescriptions. ..which I do and will
make sure they have the new medicare card.

On Jan 16, 2019, at 4:42 PM. Bella Klemn
wrote:

Please confirm that all listed pharmacies have JE medicare on file

Thank you,
Bella

EFTA_R1_01086357
EFTA02273675



Begin forwarded message:

Eu!;leci: !iue ime::

Date: January 16, 2019 at
4:41:17 PM EST
To: Karyna Shuliak

Hi Karvna,

Below please find pharmacy charges on your Blue Amex. Please
let me know if all charges for

JE.

(1/09/2019 CAMBRIDGE CHEMISTS
650000006976875 - NEW YORK, 13.05p
NY

01/09/2019 CAMBRIDGE CHEMISTS
630000006976875 - NEW YORK, 387.99pl
NY

01/09/2019 THIRD AVE APOTHECARY - New .
. v 264 48p
York, NY

01/09/2019 f;i I [][‘:.-1 I-_]{PPHARN-IA(__W - NEW 650.43p
YORK, NY

(1/08/2019 CVS/PHARMACY #10460 16,000
000010460 - NEW YORK, NY 20-40P

12/28/2018 GREENS PHARMACY
650000003499723 - PALM BEACH, 42 66p
FL

1,410.57

Thank you,
Bella
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