
To: 
From: a arRIL 
Sent Wed 1/16/2019 5:36:27 PM 
Subject: Re: 9 east 71st street 

jee asked me to change to later in the day.. 
i teed up an email and never sent but will now 
thanks for the reminder 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York. NY 10022 

On Jan 16, 2019, at 11:53 AM wrote: 

revisiting this appointment again...1 show Jeffrey is to fly to NY on Monday Jan. 21 from 
PB...Jeffrey doesn't normally fly super early...if he is to attend this meeting with 
you, I think it should be moved to later in the day....unless Jeffrey has told you 
differently...? 

On Jan 15, 2019, at 6:20 PM, Richard Kahn 
wrote: 

Can you please put in jee calendar. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York. NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: VinnY Berisha 
Date: January 15, 2019 at 5:42:50 PM EST 
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To: Ri har 1 Kahn 
Cc Meng in Dela Cruz 

Subject: Re: 9 east st street 

No problem. Yes that works for me. 

On Tue, Jan 15, 2019 at 12:35 PM Richard Kahn 
wrote: 

i just learned that mr epstein will not be in town this 
thursday.. 
are you free monday january 21st at 9am? 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

On Jan 11, 2019, at 2:53 PM, VinnY 
Berisha C > wrote: 

Hello Richard 

I'm sorry I haven't responded to your earlier email. 
Next Thursday the 17 I can meet in the morning 9am? 

On Jan 11, 2019, at 2:44 PM, Richard Kahn 
wrote: 

we are still interested in the 
project 
are you available to meet with 
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mr epstein, merwin and myself 
next thursday to review? 

please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates 
Inc. 
575 Lexington 
Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, NY 
10022 

On Dec 27, 2018, 
at 12:20 PM, 

Hi Richard 

Happy holidays. I wanted to know if you guys still want to 
go ahead with the 
steam room 

project? 

Vinny B. 
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Vinny B. 
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