
To: Bella Klei 
From: 
Sent Fri WS9 :02:27 PM 
Subject: Re  Reimbursements $211.08 

super! thanks 

> On Feb 1, 2019, at 10:01 AM, Bella Klein wrote: 

> • Giving cash to Rich 
> Thank you, 
> Bella 

» on Feb 1, 2019, at 9:26 AM, wrote: >> > Alm Reimbursement Sheet.xlsx> 
>> 

>> Morning! attached please find my reimbursements...can you please have Rich 
bring to me today when he comes to see Jeffrey? 

>> Total: $211.08 
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