
To: Jefffre E steinDeevacation@gmail.com] 
From: 
Sent /2019 2:33:08 PM 
Subject: icket was $574.89 

IM ticket price was $574.89...but I have voided it per your instruction to cancel it this 
morning.. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: J <jeevacationerrnail.COM>
Subject: Re: 
Date: February 5, 2019 at 3:09:07 PM EST 
To: Lesley Groff <lesley.jeeAqmail.com>

Ok 

On Tue, Feb 5, 2019 at 2:32 PM 

2 AA 

We can do the below for 
1 AA 1473 09FEB LAX MIA 0850A 0443P 

384 12FEB MIA LAX 0530P 0814P 

TOTAL FARE - USD 574.89 

wrote: 

On Feb 5, 2019, at 1:11 PM, J <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

La Miami sat. Tues return 
<2210AF9F-7537-461C-A8C1-39E0DAC456B6.png>--

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return c-mail or by e-mail to jecvacationagmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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