
To: 
Cc: Bella Klei 
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Thur 2/14/2019 3:53:57 PM 
Subject: Re: JE's new AMex 

we already have copies.. 
i will give to jee 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 

> On Feb 14, 2019, at 10:49 AM, wrote: 

> • I have Jeffrey's new Amex card. Rich, I will give to you to hand it to Jeffrey 
when you see him at llam. . I will also give you the paperwork that came with the 
card along with a copy of the front and back. 
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