
To gue 
From: 
Sent Mon 1/14/2019 4:18:46 PM 
Subject Re: Dr. Kline's Office 

iii Thank you for moving t ointment and confirming Jeffrey should shave! YES! Jeffrey 
would like at least 4 mo f 20MG Accutane. Can you call In to a pharmacy on St Thomas 
for us? I can get you the p one number and fax for them. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jan 14, 2019, at 10:49 AM, Jennifer Rodriguez 

Good Morning 

The appointment was moved to February 4111 at 10am and yes he should shave 

to receive the best results from the treatment. 

Dr. Kline did not prescribe Accutane at the time of his appointment, is this 

something he now wants filled? 

Jennifer Rodriguez 
Mitchell A. Kline, M.D.,P.C. mos

From: 
Sent: Monday,January , : 
To: Jennifer Rodriguez 
Subject: Re: Dr. Kline's Office 

wrote: 
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Good morning Jennifer! Hope you had a nice weekend. Jeffrey is asking if he 
must shave prior to his appointment...he is also asking to move his appointment to 
Feb. 4th...OK for you? 10am? He is also asking if Dr. Kline will prescribe 5 
months of Accutane, 20mg for him...Let me know on all when you can. Thanks, 

On Jan II, 2019, at 4:09 PM, Jennifer Rodriguez 
wrote: 

Yes, he will come in at 10am and numb for his 10:30 with Laura. 

Please keep in mind that her schedule has very limited flexibility 

due to the length of her appointments. If by chance he is running 

late please let me know ASAP. 

Thank you for your help. Have a great weekend, 

Jennifer Rodriguez 
Mitchell A. Kline, M.D.,P.C. 
Dermatolo is and Cosmetic Sur e 

From 
Sent: Friday, January 11, 2019 4:07 PM 
To: Jennifer Rodriguez 
Subject: Re: Dr. Kline's Office 

Great! Would 10am work for Dr Kline next Thursday? How long 
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will the appt take so I can block off proper timing? I'll send the 
invoice to our accounting dept. thanks! 

Sent from my iPhone 
On Jan 11 2019 at 3:46 PM Jennifer Rodriguez 

wrote: 

Hi 

Mr. Epstein would like to come in next Thursday for a 

treatment with Laura. What is his availability on the 

1710. 

Also see attached for his statement for today. 

Thank You. 

Jennifer Rodriguez 
Mitchell A. Kline, M.D.,P.C. mos

From: 
Sent: Friday, January 11, 2019 1:46 PM 
To: Jennifer Rodriguez 
Subject: Re: Dr. Kline's Office 

HI Jennifer and thank you for getting me the paper work. 
I plan to hand this to Jeffrey before he bolts out the 
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door, but just in case, I am sending this to you as well! 
I've included a copy of his Insurance Card. He still 

needs to sign and fill out the personal questions...I have 
done as much as I can for him now! 

On Jan 11, 2019, at 1:05 PM, Jennifer 
Rodri uez 

wrote: 

Hi 

Please see attached and if you have a 

copy of his insurance card I need a copy 

of that also. 

Thank You. 

Jennifer Rodriguez 
Mitchell A. Kline, M.D.,P.C. 
Dermatolos lc and Cosmetic Su e 

<PatientHistory-NEW-Jan2018.pdf><DR 
KLINE REGISTRATION NEW 2013.pdf> 
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<EPSTEIN.pdf> 
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