To: Jennifer Rodriguez

From:
Sent: Fri 1/11/2019 9:07:07 PM
Subject: Re: Dr. Kline's Office

Great! Would 10am work for Dr Kline next Thursday? How long will the appt take so | can
block off proper timing? I'll send the invoice to our accounting dept. thanks!

Sent from my 1Phone

On Jan 11, 2019, at 3:46 PM, Jennifer Rodrigucz |GG o <:

[

Mr. Epstein would like to come in next Thursday for a treatment with Laura.

What is his availability on the 17

Also see attached for his statement for today.

Thank You.

Jennifer Rodriguez
Mitchell A. Kline, M.D.,P.C.

From:
Sent: Friday, January 11, 2015 1:46 PM
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EFTA02275760



Subject: Re: Dr. Kline's Office

HI Jennifer and thank you for getting me the paper work. 1 plan to hand this to
Jeffrey before he bolts out the door, but just in case, I am sending this to you as
well! T've included a copy of his Insurance Card. He still needs to sign and fill out
the personal questions. ..I have done as much as I can for him now!

On Jan 11, 2019, at 1:05 PM, Jennifer Rodriguez
Wrote:

Please see attached and if you have a copy of his insurance card |

need a copy of that also.

Thank You.

Jennifer Rodriguez
Mitchell A, Kline, M.D.,P.C.
Dermatologic and Cosmetic Surge

<PatientHistory-NEW-Jan2018.pdf><DR KLINE REGISTRATION
NEW 2013 pdf>

<EPSTEIN . pdf>
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