
To: Bella Klein ; Rich Kahn 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent Thur 1/17/2019 1:06:52 PM 
Subject: Fwd: davos accomodation 

I I 

Please see below. Jeffrey will pay for the accommodations in Davos for Joscha and M. Still 
waiting for the info on how to pay from Someone named Yanling. Will reach out to Joscha and 
Yanling today 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: J tevacation@gmail.com>
Date: January 17 2019 at 7:48:44 AM EST 
To: Lesley Groff 
Subject: Re: davos accomodation 

yes 

On Thu, Jan 17, 2019 at 7:42 AM Lesley Groff ‹ > wrote: 

Please see below. OK to pay for accommodations for Joscha and 
davos? 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Joscha Bach 
Date: January 16, 2019 at 1:50:40 PM EST 
To: Lesley Groff 

Cc: yanling duala Gino Yu 
Subject: Re: da 

at 

Dear Yanling, I assume this is the place that we share with Gino et 
al? 

Could you please send us payment information and the address of the 
accommodation in Davos, as well as a way to reach you by phone in 
an emergency (i.e. when one of us is getting lost)? 

Dear Lesley, could you please organize the payment for and myself? 
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Bests and thank you! 

Joscha 

On Jan 16 2019 at 10:44 anling duan 
wrote: 

hi, joscha: 

welcome to share with blockbasc team, 
3500FRC/person for the week. we have few spaces left. 
please let me asap. 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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