
To: Bella Klei 
From: Lesley Grroll i
Sent: Mon 1/14/2019 9:25:14 PM 
Subject: Re: Fekkai 

had hair cut on Dec. 20 
> On Jan 14, 2019, at 4:10 PM, Bella Klein < > wrote: 

> HI Les, 
> I see 2 charges from Fekkai on December 20 and 21. I know that 1 is for 
Do you know the second charge? 
> <Amex_Black_Fekkai 245.58 122018.pdf> 
> Thank you, 
> Bella 
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