
To: 
From: J 
Sent: Thur 1/31/2019 Mit PM 
Subject: Re: Options for 

see if there is a round trip so the return is through new yoir and connects to a miami flight? 

On Thu, Jan 31, 2019 at 5:07 PM wrote: 

First class: 

I AF 99 06FEB MIA CDG 0440P 07I5A 
2 AF 6 14FEB CDG JFK 0120P 0355P 

TOTAL FARE - USD 14212.53 

Business: 

I AA 
2 AA 

62 06FEB MIA CDG 0625P 0905A 
45 I4FEB CDG JFK 0955A I235P 

TOTAL FARE - USD 8343.53 

Premium economy: 

I DL /AF 8345 06FEB MIA 
CDG 0440P 0715A 
OPERATED BY AIR FRANCE 
2 DL /AF 1022 14FEB CDG 
JFK 0815A 1040A 
OPERATED BY AIR FRANCE 

$3930.23 

Coach: 
I DL /AF 8345 06FEB MIA 
CDG 0440P 0715A 
OPERATED BY AIR FRANCE 
2 DL /AF 1022 14FEB CDG 
JFK 0815A 1040A 
OPERATED BY AIR FRANCE 

TOTAL FARE - USD 2772.23 

EFTA_R1_01090900 
EFTA02276513



Sent from my iPhone 

On Jan 31, 2019, at 4:50 PM J leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

get karyna a flight miami paris. 6th feb return 14th to new york . 
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