
To: 
From: 
Sent Fri 2/1/2019 12:24:28 AM 
Subject Re: Options forM 

good idea...but it is not helping! 

We could do one way on AF99 $8361.70 then return on La Compagna to NY for $1975.23 
($10336.93) 

The AF#99 and #6 Biz class round trip is $10,136.53 (non refundable) $10,796.53 (refundable) 
I'm told AF Service much better than La Compagna... 

Best price biz is on the American flights...$8343.53 

I am asking my guy at Sky Lux also... 

On Jan 31, 2019, at 6:02 PM, J <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

see if there is a round trip so the return is through new yoir and connects to a miami 
flight? 

On Thu, Jan 31, 2019 at 5:07 PM 

First class: 

I AF 
2 AF 

99 06FEB MIA CDG 0440P 0715A 
6 14FEB CDG JFK 0120P 0355P 

TOTAL FARE - USD 14212.53 

Business: 

I AA 
2 AA 

62 06FEB MIA CDG 0625P 0905A 
45 I4FEB CDG JFK 0955A 1235P 

TOTAL FARE - USD 8343.53 

Premium economy: 

1 DL /AF 8345 06FEB MIA 
CDG 0440P 0715A 
OPERATED BY AIR FRANCE 
2 DL /AF 1022 14FEB CDG 

wrote: 
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JFK 0815A 1040A 
OPERATED BY AIR FRANCE 

$3930.23 

Coach: 
1 DL /AF 8345 06FEB MIA 
CDG 0440P 0715A 
OPERATED BY AIR FRANCE 
2 DL /AF 1022 14FEB CDG 
JFK 0815A 1040A 
OPERATED BY AIR FRANCE 

TOTAL FARE - USD 2772.23 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jan 31, 2019, at 4:50 PM, J <frevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

get karyna a flight miami paris. 6th feb return 14th to new yoric 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jecvacation®gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
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JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any pan thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail,com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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