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thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
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On Feb 27, 2019, at 9:55 wrote: 

> I called Dr Kline office when received first invoice and provided medicare 
number. Original invoice was for S650, but with medicare it is only $199.. they 
can't overcharge as they must submit a copy to Medicare even if they don't accept 
insurance. The second invoice one charge is billed according to medicare rate and 
second charge for $350 doesn't consider medical necessity. Both invoices are paid 
and we may receive reimbursement from medicare in 2-3 weeks. 
> <Amex_Black_Dr Kline_607.15_022719.pdf> 

>> 27, 2019, at 9:31 AM, Lesley Groff <lesley.jee@gmail.com> wrote: 
>> 
>> there was also an invoice from last month for Jeffrey that still needs 
to e paid included in my last email attachment... 
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