
To: Lesley 
Grofr 

From: Bella Klein 
Sent: Mon 1/14/2019 10:07:09 PM 
Subject: Re: Fekkai 

Just called, on the 20th was 
Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

> On Jan 14, 2019, at 4:28 PM, Lesley Groff < > wrote: 

> this is the same invoice for was in Paris as of Dec. 18. 
and had their hair cut on Dec. 15th _that is all I have 

for Fekkai appointments in Dec. 

» On Jan 14, 2019, at 4:19 PM, Bella Klein < wrote: 

» I think that the second charge is fo 
» Thank you, 

>> 

>>> On Jan 14, 2019, at 4:10 PM, Bella Klein < > wrote: 
>» 
>» HI Les, 
>>> I see 2 charges from Fekkai on December 20 and 21. I know that 1 is for 

. Do you know the second charge? 
<Amex_Black_Fekka' 245.58_122018.pdf> 

>» 
>» 
>» Thank you, 
>» Bella 
>» 
>>> 
>>> 
>>> 
>>> 
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