
To: 
Cc: Larry 
From: Stephanie emington 
Sent Fri 3/15/2019 12:02:42 PM 
Subject: Re: 

Thank you, MI I so appreciate it. If you find it's better for me to wait and fly out tomorrow 
and come back Tuesday, that would be okay too. 

On Fri, Mar 15, 2019 at 7:55 AM > wrote: 

I was able to get Stephanie a ticket through Puerto Rico. Stephanie you'll need to pack light 
as Cape Air does not have a luggage agreement with Delta. You will connect to a Delta flight 
through Atlanta and then on to Kansas City arriving later in the evening tonight. As soon as I 
have the ticket I will forward it to you. Cape Air departs at 1:17 PM. I was able to get you on 
the return as well at 6 AM on Monday. I hope your father will be OK sending prayers.!!! 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 15, 2019, at 7:16 AM, Larry > wrote: 

Thx Stephie 
Sorry to hear about your father,. 
Are you def taking the American flight from STT? 

Thx 
Larry 

Sent from my iPad 

On Mar 15, 2019, at 6:39 AM, Stephanie Remington 
wrote: 

Please find attached a scan of my passport card. 
Stephanie Remington 
LSJE, LLC 

On Fri, 15 Mar 2019 at 06:04, J leevacationQgmail.com> wrote: 

stephiaie will travel with us to palm tonight. . . her father is ill , 
lesley get her a flight from palm beach 748 . to kansas city. and 
return monday from kansas city to stt. 
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please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@smail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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Stephanie Remington 
LSJE, LLC 
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