Bella Klein| majl.com

Ce: Lesley Groff
From:
Sent:  Wed 3/13/2019 3:25:04 PM

Subject: Re: -r courses

Thank you!

On Wed, 13 Mar 2019 at 17:34, Bella Klein <} G .co> wrote:
Wire sent

Thank you,

Bella

Tel:

On Mar 13, 2019, at 10:03 AM. || ] KGN

= Wrote:;

On Wed, 13 Mar 2019 at 17:02, Bella Klein _ wrote:
Les and -
[f you have approval for the request pleasc forward.

Thank you,

Bella

Tel:

On Mar 13, 2019. at 9:57 AM. | | KGN

= Wrote:
Hi Lesley!
How are you?

I'm sending you my new bank details. Could you please wire me amounts for
COUrscs

EFTA_R1_01096661
EFTA02278981



£309 visa and £3399 courses
Let me know if you need some other mformation

Thank you

Best regards,

Best resards

Best rci-ards,

Best rci-ards,

EFTA_R1_01096662
EFTA02278982



