To: Eella Klein m

From:
Sent: Tue 31972019 2:11:42 PM
Subject: Re:

do you mean there was a recent charge at Dangene’s for $40007?

On Mar 19, 2019, at 10:01 AM. Bella Klein _ wrote:

Ok, thanks. I will call them for backup
Thank you,
Bella
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wrole:

Dangene 1s Core Club. ..

Priority Care 1s Dr. Kruger’s concierge doctor service. . I don’t think the two are
related in any way?

We purchased 52 visits from Dangene back around March of 2017...

On Mar 19,2019, at 9:55 AM, Bella Klein

rote:
[s Dangene Priority care? If ves, can you please request backup for the recent
charge of $4000,

Thank you,
Bella

On Mar 19, 2019, at 9:53 AM, [ IEGEGzIzNBG

FYI...this will go toward the monies we have with Dangene already!

Begin forwarded message:
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From: J

<jeevacation{@agmail.com>

Date: March 18, 2019 at

11:11:15 PM EDT

to see dangene to get two moles
removed from her forehead

les pleae organiize for

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-chient privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jecvacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
mncluding all attachments. copyright -all rnights reserved
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