To:

Cc: Richard Kahn

From: Bella Klein

Sent: Fri 3/1/2019 8:51:17 PM

Subject: Re:IFzyment
Please print receipt confirmation and forward for backup

Thank you,
Bella

on Mar 1, 2019, at 1:49 PM, ||| -

Yes! T am in her account now and it is $1400. Paying now

: 2019 -47 PM, Richard Kahn
WIote:

is this the cost? if so then ok to pay with jee amex
thanks

Course Fees & Enroliment

$1650 (51,350 if registered by Monday, March 11, 2019}

Tuition includes classroom and program lectures, site visits, and additional
programming.

Tuition does not include accommeodation or travel.

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022
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on war 12019_at 121 pvi [ NN

wrote:

Hi Rich. -Imﬁ provided the below. Would you like me to try to pay

with JE's Amex? or are you paying with an entity? Just
let me know how I can help.

Begin forwarded message:

From [

Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein

Date: 19 at 1:17:02 PM EST
To:

Payment only can be done in account when log in... I will give you my
in acc ctail.

Email
Pass:

[n this link below:

Enroll now - Summer study - New York - Art Market Basics for
Artists

I'm attaching information if it’s would be deleted in account
<IMG_4196 jpg=

Thank you

On Fri, 1 Mar 2019 at 19:27,
W .

yes please...we need it.. .if they sent you a
link for payment, can you forward ...

On Mar 1, 2019, at 12:26 PM,

_‘n.-mtc:
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Yes, I'm registered there, and payment is in that account. Should
[ give you my log in
information?

On Fri. 1 Mar 2019 at 18:46,
WIoLe:

Ok, and you are registered?
we simply need to pay?

On Mar 1, 2019,

40 AM, i}

wrote:

Flcllo-[ would like to take these courses:

Links 15 there :

Thank you!

On Fri, 1 Mar 2019 at 14:1{;_-
.' WTIolc:

Hl.:l]nm

Circling back.
Can you please
provide me with
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the details of
your class(s) you
would hke to
take? Is there a
payment hink or
INVOICE you can
forward? I need
to give our
accounting
department the
details so they
can pay for you.!

'I'hinki
Assistant to Jeffrey Epstein.

Sent from my 1Phone
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