
To: 
Cc: Bella Klein 
From: fames I personal genius 
Sent: Fri 3/29/2019 6:48:56 PM 
Subject: Re: 7 J 

I am currently available: 
Tuesday 4-6PM 
Wednesday-Friday 10-6PM 

Thank you, 

James Ce 
your own Personal Genius 

Certified Support Professional 10.6 
htto://oersonaloenius.co 
On Mar 29, 2019, at 2:27 PM. 

Richard Kahn 

wrote: 

Ok thanks. James when might you be available? 

Sent from my iPhonc 

On Mar 29, 2019, at 2:04 PM, Bella Klein wrote: 

Bella 

He can definitely assist 
Thank you, 

On Mar 29 2019 at 1:58 PM,I 
wrote: 

Maybe James could give Yoni a lesson on Apple TV? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 29, 2019, at 1:50 PM, Bella Klein wrote: 
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It is a lot of work for 6 weeks of TV, we 
have to make an appointment for a 
technician to come and install and after 
disconnect a return box, multiple people 
involved and many calls to Time Warner.. 
Thank you, 

Bella 

n M 29 2019 1:46 PM, 

wrote: 

Ok thanks. 
Bella, before I ask Jeffrey if it is ok to get cable for Yoni, is it 

possible to just get cable for the 
one apartment for the 6 weeks 
he is here with the family? Or 
too much trouble? Money? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 29, 2019, at 1:31 PM, 'alms ersonal cnius 

wrote: 

Cable television 
was disconnected 
when we installed 
the Apple TVs in 
summer of 2018 
per Jeffrey's 
instructions. 

Thank you, 

James Ce 
your own 
Personal Genius 

Certified 
Support 

EFTA_R1_01098021 

EFTA02279436



Professional 10.6 
http://personalqe 
nius.co 

On Mar 29, 2019, at 12:52 PM, 

wrote: 

Hi 
James/ 
Bella. 
Please 
see 
below 
Did we 
get 
Yoni 
cable 
last 
time 
they 
stayed? 
The 
family 
will be 
here 
for 6 
weeks 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Yoni "oniek@netvision,netil>
Date: March 29, 2019 at 12:49:06 PM EDT 
To: 
Subject: 7 J 

Hi 
Last time there was a TV cable in the 
apartment. 
Is it possible to install the cables also this 
time? 
Thank you 
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Yoni Koren 

rib n'wi-iPad on; 
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