
To: 
From: 
Sent: 
Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein 

Yes, he did and they spoke andillis waiting to hear back about how J wants to 
proceed as far as whether J will come out here oril will go there or none of the 
above. 

Wed 3/6/2019 2:35:14 PM 

> On Mar 6, 2019, at 4:26 AM, Lesley Groff < > wrote: 

> Hi . Just following up. Has had a chance to view Jeffrey's 
MRI's? Keep me posted. No rush just want to make sure I am on top of it all. 
Lesley. 

> Sent from my iPhone 

» On Feb 26, 2019, at 4:46 PM, > wrote: 

» 
>> 
>» On Feb 26, 2019, at 1:05 PM, Lesley Groff < > wrote: 
>» 
>>> yes, I included already...after I sent the email I thought it's just best to 
send both! 
>» He will receive tomorrow in the afternoon. 
>» 
>» Tracking II -
>> >
>>> Your return label is printed and included as well! Let me know when you send 
back to I can track it and alert the house to watch for package... 
>> >
>» thanks, Lesley 
>» 
»» On Feb 26, 2019, at 4:03 PM, wrote: 
>>» 
»» Both would be great. 
>>>> 
>»» On Feb 26, 2019, at 12:31 PM, Lesley Groff < > wrote: 
>>>» 
>>>>> Ok super. 
>>>>> I have results from an MRI of Jeffrey's back from Jan. 18, 2018 and also an 
MRI of the spine from Jan. 30, 2018. Would like both? or just the MRI? 
> > > > > 
>>>» 
>>»» On Feb 26, 2019, at 3:16 PM, 
wrote: 
>>>>» 
>>>>» Hello Lesley, 
>>>>>> The address is 
>>>>» 
>>>>» 
>>>>>> 
>>>>» 
>>>>» I will be sure to take it to Fed Ex after he has reviewed them, The return 
label will make it easy. Thank you. 
>>>>» 
>>»» I hope all is well with you. 
>>>>>> Happy new year belated! 00 
>>>>» 
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>>>»» On Feb 26, 2019, at 8:39 AM, Lesley Groff > wrote: 
>>>>>» 
>>>>>>> Hi ! Hope you are well. Jeffrey would like me to send his MRI of 
his back to your husband...can you please give me his details and the address to 
Fed Ex to? Jeffrey also wants to make sure it is all fed ex'd back to us once he 
has reviewed—I can provide aFed Ex return label... 
>>>>>» 
>>>>>>> Thanks, Lesley 
>>>>>>> 
>>>>> 
>» 
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