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From: Lesley Groff
Sent: Fri 3/1/2018 7:22:01 PM

Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein
very welcome
On Mar 1, 2019, at 2:19 PM, D. DS. <} | | |G- -

Thank so much Lesley!

On Fri, 1 Mar 2019 at 20:53, Lesley Gmﬂ"*- wrote:

Thank you -_r [ have paud for your school. you are all set. 1 will send you
the confirmation.

On Mar 1, 2019, at 1:17 PM, D. DS. <[ - o

Payment only can be done in account when log in... [ wall give you my log in
account detail.

Email :
Pass:

In this link below:
https://www sothebysinstitute. com/new-yvork/summer-institute/art-market-basics-
for-artists

Enroll now - Summer study - New York - Art Market Basics for Artists

['m attaching information if it’s would be deleted in account
<IMG_4196.jpg=>

Thank you

On Fri, 1 Mar 2019 at 19:27, Lesley ('irm}'_2=- wrote:

yes please...we need it. . .if they sent you a link for payment, can you
forward . _.

On Mar 1, 2019, at 12:26 PM, D. DS
< > wrote:
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Yes, I'm registered there, and payment is in that account. Should I give you

my log in information?

On Fri, 1 Mar 2019 at 18:46, Lesley Groff <[ R ' otc:

Ok, and vou are registered? we simply need to pay?

On Mar 1, 2019, at 11:40 AM, D. DS.
wrote:

Hello Lesley. 1 would like to take these courses: Summer study, Art
Market Basics for Artists, June 3 -7
2019

Links is there :

https://'www,sothebysinstitute com/new-york/summer-institute/art-
market-basics-for-artists

Thank you!

On Fri, 1 Mar 2019 at 14:16, Lesley Groff <[ || GG

Wrote:

Hello - Circling back. Can you

please provide me with the details of
your class(s) you would like to take? Is
there a payment link or invoice you can
forward? 1 need to give our accounting
department the details so they can pay
for you.!

Thanks,
Lesley
Assistant to Jeffrey Epstein.

Sent from my 1Phone
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