
To: Lesley Groff 
From: J 
Sent: Mon 4/22/2019 7:18:09 PM 
Subject: Re: 

740 

On Mon, Apr 22, 2019 at 9:04 PM Lesley Groff wrote: 

Ticket she has now, is with., so to o to will be new ticket, not 
exchange. PI vi if he should take the t. 
requested th 1. 

TOTAL FARE - USD 699.00 - coach 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Apr 22, 2019, at 2:02 PM, J <jecvacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

cheang3 ticket to allS ,leave house at 8 
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