
To: 
From: Bella Klein 
Sent Mon 3/18/2019 8:18:30 PM 
Subject: Re: 

thanks 
Thank you, 
Bella 

On Mar 18, 2019, at 4:04 PM, wrote: 

I called and they promise the charge only truly went through once. Yes it says pending 
right now but if you watch over next few days only one charge will actually go 
through. The pending status will disappear. It is just something you will have to 
check on in a few days! 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 18, 2019, at 3:59 PM, Bella Klein wrote: 

please forward receipt 
Thank you, 
Bella 

On Mar IS. 2019 at 3:52 PM 
otc: 

Yes I will check. They were having issues with their machine when I called. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 18, 2019, at 3:44 PM, Bella Klein O> wrote: 

Hal 
Can you please double check with the place.. 

Thank you, 
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Bella 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: J 
leevacationedmail.com>
Date: March 18, 2019 at 
3:40:26 PM EDT 
To: bellaklein 

Richard Kahn 

i noticed two charges from beta blu exactly the same? 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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