From:
Sent: Mon 4/22/2019 11:00:53 PM
Subject: Re: Invoice 0000478 from NR CONTRACTING LLC

To:  _Norman Romero NN

check in the mail!

> On Apr 22, 201%, at @:Z% PM, NR CONTRACTING LLC _ wrote:

» ¥You have received an invoice from WNR CONTRACTING LLC for $250.00. To wiew,
print or downlocad a PDF copy of your invoice, click the link below

> nttps://www.aynax.com/plix-tjzz=-ycb].view

P A

> Best regards,

> NR CONTRACTING LLC —
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