From:
Sent: Sat 4/8/2019 10:51:52 PM

Subject: Re: File Credit Card Authorization Form has been signed at The Westin Palace, Milan

fantastic! thanks

On Apr 6, 2019, at 6:24 PM, Cindy C Steinbeck _

wiote:
The form was received. Have a great weekend.
CINDY STEINBECK | RELATIONSHIF MANAGER

AMERICAN EXPRESS TRAVEL & LIFESTYLE SERVICES

[

<image001.png>

From: FLORIANA ALIOTTI [mailt_
Sent: Saturday, April &, 2019 2:31 PM
To: Cindy C Steinbeck _

Subject: File Credit Card Authorization Form has been signed at The Westin Palace, Milan

All signatures requested by FLORIANA ALIOTTI (Th
Palace, Milan) have
been received for "CC Auth Form - English” in the fil
Card Authorization Form".

You may view the signed document by clicking the buttc
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Alternatively to view the document you may copy and paste the fol
your
browser: https://www sertifi. com/\WestinPalaceMilan MILWI/r aspx?1
bs

Powered by Sertifi
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350 N LaSalle 51-300, Chicago, IL 60654

American Express made the following annotations

*This message and any attachments are solely for the intended recipient and may contain confidential or
privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, use, or
distribution of the information

included in this message and any attachments is prohibited. If vou have received this communication in
error, please notify us by reply e-mail and immediately and permaneantly delete this message and
any attachments. Thank you "

American Express a ajouté le commentaire suivant le

Ce courrier et toute piéce jointe qu'il contient sont réservés au seul destinataire indiqué et peuvent
renfermer des renseignements confidentiels et privilégiés. Si vous n'étes pas le destinataire
prévu, toute divulgation, duplication, utilisation ou distribution du courrier ou de toute piéce jointe
est interdite. Si vous avez regu cette communication par erreur, veuillez nous en aviser par
courrier et détruire immédiatement le courrier et les piéces jointes. Merci.
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