
To: Bella Klei 
From: 
Sent Fri 4/12/2019 5:19:59 PM 
Subject: Re: Bella Blue 

Agree!! 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Apr 12, 2019, at 12:16 PM, Bella Kleina wrote: 

OK, will handle it. I like fully refundable, less confusing 
Thank you, 
Bella 

On Apr 12, 2019, at 12:13 PM, 
wrote: 

yes! 14-21... 
I see Jeffrey says he is going to Paris on Friday April 19th...I fear it mean MANY 

tickets and changes...actually,...it is more purchasing of tickets next 
week....then changing them all once he is there (that will be when I 
am back and you are away) Hoping you can help...if you need details 
of anyone you can email me for them...buy fully refundable when it 
makes sense.. in Paris and can help too of course. 

On Apr 12, 2019, at 12:10 PM, Bella Klein 

wrote:

you are leaving on 14th, correct? 
Thank you, 
Bella 

On A r 12 2019 at 12:09 PMI 
wrote: 
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ah! oops...yes, I have that in the calendar! 

On Apr 12, 2019, at 12:07 PM, 
Bella Klein 

wrote: 

I am at work. I am leaving on 21st - 26th.. 
Thank you, 
Bela 

On Apr 12, 2019, 
at 12:05 PM, 

ok....why are you looking at this on your vacation!!!???? 

On Apr 
12, 
2019, 
at 
12:01 
PM, 
Bella 
Klein 

wrote: 

ok, i already called, but need to call on Monday..no 
worries 

Thank you, 
Bella 
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On Apr 12, 2019, at 11:57 AM, 

wrote: 

I do not. 
but I'm sure they will sec that it is the exact 
same charge on the same day... 

On A r 12 2019 at 11:52 AM, Bella 
Klein wrote: 

Do you have a receipt.. 
Thank you, 
Bella 

On A r 12 2019 at 11:43 AM, 

wrote: 

I do not. Just whoever answers. 
They will sec they charged twice. 
They told me it didn't go though 
the first time but it appears it did! 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Apr 12, 2019, at 11:18 AM, 

wrote: 

They charged twice. Do 
you have a contact to call 

03/18/2019BELLA BLU 
00091220012734076.22 
NEW YORK, NY 

03/18/2019
BELLA BLU 

76 22 
000912200127340 - ' 
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NEW YORK, NY 
Thank you, 
Bella 
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