oo
From: Matalia Molotkova
Sent: Mon 5/13/2019 3:10:20 PM

Subject: Flights to Germany

Title: American Express ®

It still should be on itinerary - | can hold till May 16 7am.

Regards,
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

how long can we hold Joscha's tickets and the families tickets? (the emails with itineraries no
longer state how long tickets will be held. they used to have a statement in RED about how long

the tickets would hold for)

got it.._lets hold them please. I'll bet Jeffrey pays in the end. That is a lot of money for a young

family.

Family: no discounts for kids

1 LH 455 D9JUL SFO FRA 0255P 1045A
1 LH 182 10JUL FRA TXL 1145A 1255P

2 LH 185 16AUG TXL FRA 1145A 1255P
3 LH 454 18AUG FRA SFO 1025A 1250FP
2ADT 2298.03 4596.06

1TADT 2298.03 2298.03
TOTAL FARE - USD 6894.09

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager
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Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

got it regarding Easy Jet flights. | will take care of them. Thank you for the below. | will await the
flights for the family. thank you!

| can't book EasyJet, you will have to do it online, on EasyJet web site,please.
Mr. Bach itinerary

1 LH 455 09JUL SFO FRA 0255P 1045A
1 LH 104 10JUL FRA MUC 1215P 0110P

2 LH 2040 12JUL MUC TXL 0210P 0315P
3 LH 454 18AUG FRA SFO 1025A 1250P
TOTAL FARE - USD 2492.33

Working on his family's itinerary.

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

On it.

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST
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HI Natasha.._please see below specific details for the Bach family. | have also included their P
details. Please keep Joscha's ticket separate from the families as | think Jeffrey will only pay for
Joscha's portion. They may need to write Jeffrey a check for their own portion. Thanks, Lesley
Aino Zora Bach

Taiyo Anatol Bach

GLUTEN FREE MEAL

Mira Maria Bach

GLUTEN FREE MEAL

Joscha Bach
Male

JOSCHA REQUIRES VEGITARIAM MEAL

Begin forwarded message:

From: Joscha Bach |-

Subject: Flights to Germany
Date: May 11, 2019 at 1:26:18 PM EDT
To

Ce: Mira Bach <
pear[I

| hope this finds you welll

Could you please help us with flights to Germany again?

Qur plan is to travel from SFO to FRA on July 8th. | have to speak at a conference in
Munich, so | will continue to MUC, and Mira, Taiyo and Aino go to BER:

SFO-FRA July 9th 2:55 PM - 10:45 AM+1 (LH 455)
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Flights to Berlin for Mira, Aino and Taiyo:
FRA-TXL July 10th 11:45 AM -12:55 PM (LH 182)
Flight to MUC for Joscha:

FRA-MUC July 10th 12:15 PM - 1:10 PM (LH 104)
Flight to Berlin for Joscha:

MUC-TXL July 12th 3:15 PM (LH 2040)

From July 20th to 25th, we would like to attend a physics conference of the Foundational
Cluestions Institute in Pisa;
(all four of us)

SXF-PSA July 20th 12:00 PM=-2PM (easyJet U2 4583)
PSA-SXF July 25th 1:40 PM=3:35 PM (easyJet U2 4584)

Mira, Aine and Taiyo will fly from Berlin to Frankfurt on August 16th
TXL-FRA August 16th 11:45 AM-12:55 PM (LH 185)

| will be on an Al conference in Shenzen (my company sponsors that flight) and rejoin them
on the return flight in Frankfurt:

(all of us):

FRA-SFO August 18th 10:25 AM-12:50 PM (LH 454)

Thank you very much,
With kind regards from San Francisco,

Joscha and Mira
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