To wlﬂch Ka h_

From:
Sent: Thur 5/23/2019 6:29:30 PM
Subject: Fwd: Carluz/Arline Vacation Request

Begin forwarded message:

From: J <jeevacation@gmail.com=>
Subject: Re: Carluz/Arline Vacation Request
Date: May 23, 2019 at 2:27:44 PM EDT

yes

On Thu, May 23, 2019 at 1:33 PM [ -

want to confirm you pay for all the tickets...Carluz, Arline and 3 kids... ?

We are planning to go to with my three kids.
16-30 Philippines and 1-14 n France.
Thank you

Carluz N. Toylo

On May 23, 2019, at 10:57 AM, J <jeevacation(@gmail com™> wrote:

yes, and 1 pay

On Thu, May 23, 2019 at 10:16 AM_-‘-‘ wrote:

Carluz and Arline would like to take their family vacation June 16-
July 14.
Renato returns from his vacation at 11:09pm on June 10th.

OK for Carluz and Arline to take June 16-July 14 off?

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-chent privileged, may
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Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail. com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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