
To: Daphne Wallace 
Cc: Ann Rocincluez ia 
Fran: Richard Kahn 
Sent Wed 5/22/2019 6:26:39 PM 
Subject: Punchlist #40 - Flagpole Pool Awing 

daphne / anna 
it appears that glidden never did anything with awning and jee would now like you to take over 
and get it done.. 
feel free to verify with him however jee would like you to obtain same heavy duty awning for 
flagpole pool that he has at PBI house 
jee says what brice purchased is not good quality 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

On A r 25 2019 at 5:20 PM, Richard Kahn 
wrote: 

mike can you please provide an update on outdoor awning 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
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On Apr 8, 2019, at 8:48 AM, Richard Kahn 

ca' wrote: 

mike 
can you please provide an update on awning.. 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
I-IBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

From: ann rodriquez 
Subject: Re: Outdoor awning 
Date: March 18, 2019 at 11:22:30 AM EDT 
To: michael lidden , Daphne Wallace 
< , CARLUZ TOYLO 
Cc: Karyna Shuliak 
Richard Kahn , Steph 

Hi Michael, 

Please advise that you've recetved all info from Carluz pertaining to the Awning? 
I believe Carluz is under the impression that I'm responsible for the LSJ awning project. 

Thank you, 
Ann R. 

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this e-mail may be 
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privileged,confidential, and protected from disclosure. If you are not the 
intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, 
distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you 
have received this communication in error, please notify the 
sender immediately and delete all copies. 

On Monday, March 18, 2019 10:54:39 AM -04, CARLUZ TOYLO <-i> wrote: 

Here are few photo that may help you . 

Karluz N. Toyto 

MI= 

> On Mar 18, 2019, at 07:43, michael glidden < wrote: 

> Good morning. 
> I will get pricing and availability for units to go on each of the gazebos along side both pools as soon 

as I get the info. 
> Thank you. 

» On Mar 17, 2019, at 11:26 PM, Karyna Shuliak IMI > wrote: 
>> 

» Hi Carluz, 

» Mr. Epstein asked if you could please find out who is the manufacturer of the outdoor awning that 
we have by the dining table outside. Please give the manufacturer's details to Mike. He is 
copied on this email. 

» Thank you, 

» Karyna 
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