
To: Bella Klein 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent: Thur 5/23/2019 2:10:49 PM 
Subject: Re: You have a message from Tokyo Prince Hotel 

great! 

On May 23, 2019, at 10:10 AM, Bella Klein C  wrote: 

ok, i gave additional 4k 
Thank you, 
Bella 

On M 23 2019 10:08 AM, Lesley Groff 
> wrote: 

correct. 

On Ma 23, 2019, at 10:08 AM, Bella Klein 
wrote: 

will it go on MAmcx? 
Thank you, 
Bella 

On Ma 23 2019 at 10:05 AM, Lesley 
Groff wrote: 

Grand Hyatt Tokyo (T,i h/\47v 

Confirmation number 

PIN Code 7069 

Booking Details 6 nights, 1 room Add another room 

Check-in Friday, May 24, 2019 (from 3:00 PM) 

Check-out Thursday, May 30, 2019 (until 12:00 PM) 
Outlook/iCal Google calendar 

1 room 
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S3,154 
8 °A, VAT 

15 % Property service charge 
¥ 200 City tax per person per night 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Price 
(for 1 guest) 

On May 23, 2019, at 9:23 AM, 
Bella Klein 

wrote: 

On May 23, 2019, 
at 9:12 AM, Lesley 
Groff 

OK. It would be helpful if the credit card used at a hotel is 
the credit card that 
is shown the front 
desk along with ID. 
let me check out 

the price now on 
the hotel she wants. 
I'll get back to you 

On 
May 
23, 
2019, 
at 9:08 

appro) 
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AM, 
Bella 
Klein 

wrote: 

Yes, she has AMEX card and I can give you 
accoun 
t when 
in the 
office. 
I just 
keep 
her 
limit 
law as 
authori 
zed by 
JE, but 
can 
increas 
e for 
the 
authori 
zed 
purcha 
ses. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

On May 23, 2019, at 9:04 AM, Lesley Groff 

wrote: 

does ave a credit card she can use?! 
so many o these hotels do not accept 3rd 
party payment and especially don't like doing 
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it less than 48 hours in advance...she wants 
this other hotel...if I can't prepay, she can 
pay? I can send you the confirm so you can 
see the total... 

On Ma 23 2019 at 8:38 AM, Bella 
Klein > wrote: 

Please use your Amex if you need a 
card in your name. Please let me know 
estimated cost and I will increase card 
limit 

Thank you, 
Bella 

On Ma 23 2019 at 7:22 AM, Lesley 
Groff wrote: 

Thanks. 
Bella, aid for May 23rd 
and wi. Pto be reimbursed. I 
will try to book her the Prince 
Gallery Tokyo once at the house 
for May 24-29. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Ma 22 2019 at 10:48 PM, 

wrote: 

Envoye de mon iPhone 

Debut du message 
transfere : 

Expediteur: "Tokyo 
Prince Hotel via 
Booking,com"
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Date: 23 mai 2019 a 
10:56:04 UTC+9 
Destinataire: 

Objet: You have a 
message from 
Tokyo Prince Hotel 
Repondre a: 
"Tokyo Prince Hotel 
via Booking.com"

<mime-attachment.png> Conti

You 

from 

Tokyo Prince Hotel said: 

<mime-
attachment.png> 
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mime• 
attachment.png> 

Please respond to i 

You 
I am have permission and will chary 
provided the details of the card on I 
May 22.2019 

Reservation Details 

Check-in: CS 
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Thu, May 23, 2019 Fri, 

Property Name: 
Tokyo Prince Hotel 

Booking Number: 

Total guests: Totz 

1 

How would you rate t 

This info won't be shared with T 
et 

<mime-
attachment.png> 

Share ) 

C Copyright I3ookin 
This email was sent by 

RoolcitiLciat will receive and process rei 
the Booking cote Pri‘aey SI:dement. 11 

Tokyo Prins: Hotel was not generate 
Bookingcom cannot be held accountable 

Why did I receive tl 
This message is inanoronria 
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